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17 Sep 2013 To cultivate the role of this initiative among the
other programs, there are also some difficulties to be
overcome. First, the mutual understanding among the various
local bodies in handling the control program, which is one of
the main difficulties to be overcome, is an important
condition for the success of this control program. The result
of the first pilot program is an example. Haematological and
Oncological Diseases, Hematology, Pathology, and
Laboratory Medicine: AClinical & Therapeutic Neuryothesis:
Applied Neurophysiology. вЂњNew satellite programs (e.g.,
Satellite-2) are cost-effective; resources for development and
conduct of the satellite programs are allocated through the
negotiations between the delegating countries. However,
because of the fact that different countries do not have equal
resources, frequent disagreements arise concerning the
realization of satellite programs. This may result in the
failure of some satellite programs and delays in the
establishment of new ones.В вЂњInternational programs are
needed for non-profit humanitarian purposes (e.g., a project
to build a water pipe for a town in Iran). However, to be
effective, these programs must be implemented in
conjunction with other international programs and, in
particular, they have to complement the activities of the
United Nations Development Fund for Women (UNIFEM).
If the new program does not take into account the existing
programs, the results achieved by the project may be weak.В
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вЂњMost of the international programs are linked to the
United Nations, and the OrganizationвЂ™s head of
Delegation informs the co-sponsors of the international
projects. In addition, this may result in additional costs or
complications in the assessment of the project.
вЂњPreparation of a program is a time-consuming process: it
requires collaboration with various UN agencies, co-sponsors,
and other project partners, as well as the assistance of a staff
of specialists, such as attorneys, consultants, and expert
communicators; вЂќ he wrote. в� 1cb139a0ed
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